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Prepare to be captivated by "Dragon Born," a spellbinding teen dragon
shifter romance that will ignite your imagination and leave you breathless.
Step into a realm where dragons soar above majestic mountains, their
scales shimmering with iridescent hues. Enter a world where love blooms
amidst ancient secrets and where destiny intertwines the fates of a young
woman and a captivating dragon shifter.

A Heart-Pounding Journey of Love and Discovery

At the heart of "Dragon Born" lies the enchanting tale of Anya, a seemingly
ordinary teenager who harbors a secret that sets her apart from the rest of
the world. As she navigates the complexities of high school, little does she
know that her life is about to take an extraordinary turn. When fate brings
her face-to-face with Ethan, a mysterious and alluring dragon shifter, her
world is irrevocably transformed.

Ethan, with his piercing gaze and enigmatic aura, is a guardian of the
ancient dragon realm. As he crosses paths with Anya, he discovers in her a
kindred spirit—a soul as untamed and fiery as his own. Together, they
embark on a whirlwind journey of love, adventure, and self-discovery. But
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their blooming connection stirs ancient forces that threaten to tear them
apart.

Secrets Unraveled, Destinies Intertwined

"Dragon Born" is more than just a captivating romance; it's a tapestry of
secrets and ancient prophecies. As Anya and Ethan delve deeper into their
connection, they uncover a hidden world filled with mythical creatures and
age-old feuds. The shadows of the past threaten to cast a shadow over
their newfound love, forcing them to confront their fears and embrace their
true destinies.

Amidst the breathtaking landscapes and heart-pounding action, "Dragon
Born" explores the themes of identity, acceptance, and the power of love to
conquer all obstacles. Through Anya and Ethan's journey, readers will
witness the transformative power of embracing one's true self and the
unyielding bonds that can unite two souls from different worlds.
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A Literary Masterpiece for the Ages

With its vivid imagery, captivating characters, and heart-stopping plot,
"Dragon Born" is a literary masterpiece that will transport you to a world of
wonder and enchantment. The author's masterful storytelling weaves a
tapestry of suspense, romance, and mythical adventure that will leave you
spellbound from the first page to the last. Prepare to be swept away by a
tale that will ignite your imagination and stay with you long after you've
finished reading.

Unleash the Fire Within

If you're ready to embark on an extraordinary literary journey, then "Dragon
Born" is the book for you. This captivating teen dragon shifter romance is a
symphony of love, adventure, and self-discovery that will ignite the fire
within you. Dive into the enchanting world of Anya and Ethan, where
dragons soar, secrets unfold, and love conquers all.

Free Download your copy of "Dragon Born" today and experience the
magic firsthand.
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