
Journey to New Grenada: The Grenada
Revolution
A Historical Adventure Novel

Journey to New Grenada: The Grenada Revolution is a historical adventure
novel that tells the story of the Grenada Revolution, a Marxist-Leninist
revolution that took place on the Caribbean island of Grenada in 1979. The
novel follows the experiences of a young American woman who travels to
Grenada to join the revolution, and her experiences there as the revolution
unfolds.

The novel is based on extensive research into the Grenada Revolution, and
it provides a unique perspective on this important event in Caribbean
history. The novel is also a gripping adventure story, with a strong female
protagonist who is determined to make a difference in the world.
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The Grenada Revolution

The Grenada Revolution was a Marxist-Leninist revolution that took place
on the Caribbean island of Grenada in 1979. The revolution was led by the
New Jewel Movement, a Marxist-Leninist party that had been founded in
1973. The New Jewel Movement overthrew the government of Prime
Minister Eric Gairy, and established a People's Revolutionary Government.

The People's Revolutionary Government implemented a number of radical
policies, including the nationalization of key industries, the establishment of
a free healthcare system, and the expansion of educational opportunities.
The government also sought to improve relations with Cuba and other
socialist countries.

The Grenada Revolution was met with hostility by the United States, which
saw it as a threat to its interests in the Caribbean. In 1983, the United
States invaded Grenada, overthrowing the People's Revolutionary
Government and installing a pro-American government.

The Novel

Journey to New Grenada: The Grenada Revolution tells the story of the
Grenada Revolution from the perspective of a young American woman
named Sarah. Sarah is a recent college graduate who is disillusioned with
the state of the world. She travels to Grenada to join the revolution, and
she quickly becomes involved in the struggle for a better future.

The novel follows Sarah's experiences as she learns about the revolution,
and as she comes to terms with the challenges and complexities of living in
a revolutionary society. The novel also explores the personal relationships



that Sarah forms with other revolutionaries, and the sacrifices that they are
willing to make for their cause.

Journey to New Grenada: The Grenada Revolution is a powerful and
moving novel that tells a unique and important story. The novel is a must-
read for anyone who is interested in the Grenada Revolution, or in the
history of the Caribbean.

About the Author

John Smith is a historian and author who has written extensively about the
Caribbean. He is the author of several books, including **The Grenada
Revolution: A History** and **The Caribbean: A History of the Region**. He
lives in New York City.
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protagonist who is determined to make a difference in the world.
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