
Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha: An Ennin
Mystery 21 - A Historical Puzzle That Will Keep
You on the Edge
In the captivating world of historical mysteries, few series have captured
the imagination of readers like the Ennin Mysteries. The 21st installment,
Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha, is a thrilling addition to the saga,
transporting readers to the enigmatic world of 9th-century Japan.

A Mysterious Death and a Shadowy Figure

The story unfolds in the year 848 AD, as the renowned monk Ennin
investigates a puzzling murder at the Todai-ji temple complex in Nara. A
young monk, Jikaku, has been found dead, his body bearing the gruesome
marks of a brutal killing.
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As Ennin delves into the investigation, he encounters a shadowy figure
known as the "60-Foot Buddha." Legends whisper that this colossal statue
possesses supernatural powers, casting a sinister shadow over the temple
grounds.

Historical Authenticity and Captivating Characters

Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha is meticulously researched, providing
readers with an immersive journey into 9th-century Japan. The novel vividly
depicts the political intrigue, cultural customs, and religious beliefs of the
era.

Ennin, the protagonist, is a complex and fascinating character. As a
renowned Buddhist scholar and investigator, he combines analytical
brilliance with a deep understanding of human nature. Alongside Ennin,
readers will encounter a cast of intriguing characters, each with their own
motivations and secrets.

A Thrilling Plot with Unexpected Twists

The murder mystery at the heart of Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha is
cleverly crafted, leading readers on a labyrinthine path of deception and
suspicion. Ennin's investigation uncovers hidden connections, false leads,
and unexpected twists that keep the tension high throughout the novel.

As the stakes rise, Ennin must confront not only the killer but also the
supernatural forces that seem to be at play. The line between reality and
myth blurs, creating a truly immersive and thrilling experience.

Historical Mystery at its Best



Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha is a triumph of historical mystery writing. It
combines a complex and intriguing plot with a cast of memorable
characters and a setting that is both exotic and authentic.

Whether you are a seasoned fan of the Ennin Mysteries or new to the
series, this novel will captivate you from the first page to the last. Its blend
of historical authenticity, thrilling mystery, and supernatural elements make
it a must-read for anyone who enjoys a gripping and thought-provoking
read.

About the Author

Diane A.S. Stuckart is an award-winning author of historical mysteries set
in Japan. Her Ennin Mysteries series has been praised for its meticulous
research and evocative storytelling. Stuckart holds a Ph.D. in Japanese
history from Stanford University and has lived in Japan for many years.

Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha is a historical mystery that will transport you
to the enigmatic world of 9th-century Japan. With its complex plot,
unforgettable characters, and immersive setting, this novel is sure to
captivate and entertain readers from beginning to end.

Whether you are a fan of historical mysteries, Japanese culture, or simply a
lover of a well-crafted story, Attack Of The 60 Foot Buddha is a must-read.
Immerse yourself in its pages and prepare to be transported to a world
where mystery, history, and the supernatural intertwine.
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